ROAD COMMISSION for MONTCALM COUNTY

GRAVEL RESURFACING - LIMESTONE

BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 9, 2026 - 1:00 P.M.

PRICE PER TON

Verplank Trucking Yellow Rose Fisher Transportation
Township 23A 23A 23A
Belvidere $34.50 $31.15 $34.55
Bloomer $35.50 $32.65 $33.69
Bushnell $34.75 $32.65 $36.48
Cato $33.75 $30.15 $35.68
Crystal $36.00 $32.90 $33.27
Day $35.25 $32.90 $33.27
Douglass $34.50 $31.65 $35.30
Eureka $33.25 $30.40 No Bid
Evergreen $35.25 $32.15 $35.30
Fairplain $34.00 $31.40 No Bid
Ferris $36.00 $33.15 $32.35
Home $35.25 $32.65 $32.35
Maple Valley $33.00 $31.40 No Bid
Montcalm $33.75 $30.35 No Bid
Pierson $32.25 $29.15 No Bid
Pine $33.75 $31.40 $36.48
Reynolds $32.50 $29.25 No Bid
Richland $36.00 $33.15 $31.35
Sidney $34.50 $31.40 No Bid
Winfield $33.00 $29.90 No Bid




