ROAD COMMISSION for MONTCALM COUNTY

GRAVEL RESURFACING - NATURAL

BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 9, 2026 - 1:00 P.M.

PRICE PER TON

Fisher Transportation L&D Carey Alpine Contracting
Township 23A 23A 23A
Belvidere $16.99 $26.60 $33.15
Bloomer $17.26 $22.05 No Bid
Bushnell $18.05 $24.53 No Bid
Cato $18.05 $26.40 $30.12
Crystal $15.94 $20.00 No Bid
Day $16.23 $19.40 No Bid
Douglass $17.52 $22.05 $33.25
Eureka $20.68 $21.00 $30.12
Evergreen $16.99 $20.00 No Bid
Fairplain $18.84 $23.30 No Bid
Ferris $15.12 $19.40 No Bid
Home $16.23 $29.00 $33.25
Maple Valley $22.96 $23.40 $30.12
Montcalm $19.10 $21.87 $32.12
Pierson $25.33 $22.58 $27.09
Pine $18.31 $24.00 $33.15
Reynolds $22.96 $21.27 $27.09
Richland $15.12 $30.39 No Bid
Sidney $18.31 $24.38 No Bid
Winfield $20.89 $21.69 $28.09




