

ROAD COMMISSION for MONTCALM COUNTY
CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 14, 2021 - 1:00 P.M.

VENDOR		Cadillac Culvert		
SIZE / GAUGE	STANDARD METAL	2' METAL BAND	POLYMER COATED	2' POLYMER BAND
12" Dia., 14 Ga.	15.00	25.00	No Bid	No Bid
15" Dia., 14 Ga.	18.65	30.00	No Bid	No Bid
18" Dia., 14 Ga.	22.55	38.00	No Bid	No Bid
24" Dia., 14 Ga.	30.15	48.00	No Bid	No Bid
30" Dia., 14 Ga.	38.00	64.00	No Bid	No Bid
36" Dia., 14 Ga.	46.20	80.00	No Bid	No Bid
42" Dia., 12 Ga.	76.70	110.00	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia., 12 Ga.	87.65	140.00	No Bid	No Bid
VENDOR		Jensen Bridge		
12" Dia., 14 Ga.	17.52	32.40	20.27	40.54
15" Dia., 14 Ga.	21.77	40.26	25.14	50.28
18" Dia., 14 Ga.	25.39	50.78	30.00	60.00
24" Dia., 14 Ga.	35.73	71.46	42.19	84.38
30" Dia., 14 Ga.	45.82	91.64	52.52	105.04
36" Dia., 14 Ga.	54.35	108.70	64.04	128.08
42" Dia., 12 Ga.	84.78	169.56	97.08	194.16
48" Dia., 12 Ga.	96.89	193.78	112.35	224.70
VENDOR		St. Regis		
12" Dia., 14 Ga.	18.30	36.60	36.00	72.00
15" Dia., 14 Ga.	23.01	46.02	45.00	90.00
18" Dia., 14 Ga.	27.62	55.24	54.00	108.00
24" Dia., 14 Ga.	36.82	73.65	72.00	144.00
30" Dia., 14 Ga.	46.80	93.60	90.00	180.00
36" Dia., 14 Ga.	56.20	112.40	108.00	216.00
42" Dia., 12 Ga.	89.10	178.20	172.00	344.00
48" Dia., 12 Ga.	101.60	203.20	195.00	390.00
VENDOR				
12" Dia., 14 Ga.				
15" Dia., 14 Ga.				
18" Dia., 14 Ga.				
24" Dia., 14 Ga.				
30" Dia., 14 Ga.				
36" Dia., 14 Ga.				
42" Dia., 12 Ga.				
48" Dia., 12 Ga.				