

**ROAD COMMISSION for MONTCALM COUNTY**

**CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT**

**BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 9, 2021 - 1:00 P.M.**

<b>VENDOR</b>		<b>Cadillac Culvert</b>		
<b>SIZE / GAUGE</b>	<b>STANDARD METAL</b>	<b>2' METAL BAND</b>	<b>POLYMER COATED</b>	<b>2' POLYMER BAND</b>
12" Dia., 14 Ga.	10.35	16.00	No Bid	No Bid
15" Dia., 14 Ga.	12.75	21.00	No Bid	No Bid
18" Dia., 14 Ga.	15.35	25.00	No Bid	No Bid
24" Dia., 14 Ga.	22.00	33.00	No Bid	No Bid
30" Dia., 14 Ga.	26.00	42.00	No Bid	No Bid
36" Dia., 14 Ga.	30.65	52.00	No Bid	No Bid
42" Dia., 12 Ga.	49.30	85.00	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia., 12 Ga.	55.90	95.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>VENDOR</b>		<b>Jensen Bridge</b>		
12" Dia., 14 Ga.	10.25	19.48	12.77	24.26
15" Dia., 14 Ga.	12.75	24.23	15.85	30.12
18" Dia., 14 Ga.	15.17	28.82	18.91	35.93
24" Dia., 14 Ga.	21.00	39.90	25.03	47.56
30" Dia., 14 Ga.	26.87	51.05	31.15	59.19
36" Dia., 14 Ga.	32.25	60.63	39.16	74.40
42" Dia., 12 Ga.	49.58	95.19	62.06	117.91
48" Dia., 12 Ga.	58.50	108.23	72.26	135.85
<b>VENDOR</b>		<b>St. Regis</b>		
12" Dia., 14 Ga.	10.65	21.30	No Bid	No Bid
15" Dia., 14 Ga.	14.23	28.46	No Bid	No Bid
18" Dia., 14 Ga.	17.08	34.16	No Bid	No Bid
24" Dia., 14 Ga.	22.78	45.56	No Bid	No Bid
30" Dia., 14 Ga.	28.47	56.94	No Bid	No Bid
36" Dia., 14 Ga.	34.20	68.40	No Bid	No Bid
42" Dia., 12 Ga.	54.14	108.28	No Bid	No Bid
48" Dia., 12 Ga.	61.68	123.36	No Bid	No Bid
<b>VENDOR</b>				
12" Dia., 14 Ga.				
15" Dia., 14 Ga.				
18" Dia., 14 Ga.				
24" Dia., 14 Ga.				
30" Dia., 14 Ga.				
36" Dia., 14 Ga.				
42" Dia., 12 Ga.				
48" Dia., 12 Ga.				