

ROAD COMMISSION for MONTCALM COUNTY

H.M.A. PAVING

BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 7, 2022 - 1:00 P.M.

	Central Asphalt, Mt. Pleasant, MI						Michigan Paving, Grand Rapids, MI				
	NW	NC	NE	SE	SW		NW	NC	NE	SE	SW
HMA, 13A, Mainline, Over 2000 Tons	57.81	57.08	56.87	57.84	58.29		83.46	86.19	87.60	83.56	87.07
HMA, 13A, Mainline, 1000-1999 Tons	59.70	59.70	58.86	59.38	59.70		89.97	91.70	86.80	89.07	91.50
HMA, 13A, Mainline, 500-999 Tons	62.77	61.66	60.35	60.03	61.66		104.63	106.75	104.63	107.52	109.61
HMA, 13A, Mainline, 250-499 Tons	66.88	66.88	63.57	65.23	66.88		137.95	135.25	133.45	136.42	137.25
HMA, 13A Mainline Under 250 Tons	73.21	73.21	70.73	71.00	73.21		145.96	143.21	145.76	147.92	149.64
HMA, 13A, Subdivisions	75.91	76.10	71.12	73.52	73.52		145.96	147.72	148.68	149.52	151.64
HMA, 13A, Parking Lot	111.26	111.26	111.26	111.26	111.26		153.96	151.72	153.25	155.76	157.98
HMA, Approach	115.08	115.08	115.08	115.08	115.08		167.54	169.52	167.42	169.21	170.42
HMA, Spillway	4.99	4.99	4.99	4.99	4.99		6.00	6.00	6.00	6.00	6.00
Shoulder, CL II 23A	19.05	19.05	19.05	19.05	19.05		40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00
Cold Milling, Over 6000 syd	2.09	2.09	1.84	1.84	2.09		3.50	3.50	3.50	3.50	3.50
Cold Milling, 3000-5999 syd	2.45	2.45	2.12	2.45	2.45		4.50	4.50	4.50	4.50	4.50
Cold Milling, 1000-2999 syd	4.76	4.76	4.01	4.01	4.76		9.00	9.00	9.00	9.00	9.00
Cold Milling, Under 1000 syd	8.02	8.02	8.02	8.02	8.02		16.00	16.00	16.00	16.00	16.00
Cold Milling Skid Steer Mini Mill	246.34	244.15	237.59	241.96	246.34		250.00	250.00	250.00	250.00	250.00
	Rieth-Riley, Big Rapids						Superior Asphalt, Grand Rapids, MI				
	NW	NC	NE	SE	SW		NW	NC	NE	SE	SW
HMA, 13A, Mainline, Over 2000 Tons	63.45	67.82	76.52	64.50	64.50		80.00	82.00	No Bid	No Bid	80.00
HMA, 13A, Mainline, 1000-1999 Tons	64.48	69.05	79.95	68.50	68.50		82.00	84.00	No Bid	No Bid	82.00
HMA, 13A, Mainline, 500-999 Tons	70.20	79.51	92.15	80.00	80.00		84.00	86.00	No Bid	No Bid	84.00
HMA, 13A, Mainline, 250-499 Tons	78.40	88.82	103.97	105.00	105.00		89.00	91.00	No Bid	No Bid	89.00
HMA, 13A Mainline Under 250 Tons	91.38	108.90	128.60	200.00	200.00		97.00	98.00	No Bid	No Bid	97.00
HMA, 13A, Subdivisions	82.90	91.88	96.70	75.00	75.00		97.00	98.00	No Bid	No Bid	97.00
HMA, 13A, Parking Lot	131.00	138.50	146.00	110.00	110.00		100.00	110.00	No Bid	No Bid	105.00
HMA, Approach	116.00	128.90	139.90	350.00	350.00		125.00	125.00	No Bid	No Bid	125.00
HMA, Spillway	3.50	4.50	5.50	5.00	5.00		8.00	8.00	No Bid	No Bid	8.00
Shoulder, CL II 23A	28.90	31.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		33.00	33.00	No Bid	No Bid	33.00
Cold Milling, Over 6000 syd	1.60	2.75	4.00	1.60	1.60		3.00	4.00	No Bid	No Bid	3.00
Cold Milling, 3000-5999 syd	2.00	3.75	5.00	2.00	2.00		4.00	5.00	No Bid	No Bid	4.00
Cold Milling, 1000-2999 syd	4.00	5.50	6.70	2.25	2.25		5.00	6.00	No Bid	No Bid	5.00
Cold Milling, Under 1000 syd	5.90	8.50	No Bid	5.00	5.00		8.00	9.00	No Bid	No Bid	8.00
Cold Milling Skid Steer Mini Mill	250.00	250.00	300.00	750.00	750.00		265.00	265.00	No Bid	No Bid	265.00