

**ROAD COMMISSION for MONTCALM COUNTY**

**CORRUGATED PLASTIC CULVERT**

**BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 6, 2018 - 1:00 P.M.**

<b>VENDORS</b>					
	Adv Drainage Systems	Etna Supply	Vandervelde Sales	Core and Main	Jensen Bridge
<b><u>CULVERT</u></b>	Belled or Plain	Belled	Belled		Belled
12" Diameter	4.30	4.30	4.11	4.3	No Bid
15" Diameter	5.75	5.75	5.47	5.75	No Bid
18" Diameter	8.35	8.35	8.01	8.35	No Bid
24" Diameter	13.90	13.90	13.18	13.9	No Bid
30" Diameter	19.85	19.85	19.46	19.85	No Bid
36" Diameter	25.17	25.17	25.17	25.17	No Bid
42" Diameter	34.31	34.31	34.31	34.31	No Bid
48" Diameter	41.36	41.36	41.36	41.36	No Bid
<b><u>BANDS</u></b>					No Bid
12" Bands	6.26	6.26	5.63	6.26	No Bid
15" Bands	10.43	10.43	8.44	10.43	No Bid
18" Bands	17.77	17.77	11.87	17.77	No Bid
24" Bands	25.06	25.06	20.71	25.06	No Bid
30" Bands	58.26	58.26	33.41	58.26	No Bid
36" Bands	81.06	81.06	No Bid	81.06	No Bid
42" Bands	118.65	118.65	No Bid	118.65	No Bid
48" Bands	139.28	139.28	No Bid	132.28	No Bid

**NOTES:**

\*\*\*ADS & Etna- Minimum \$3500 order or \$50.00 drop off fee applies.

\*\*\*Haviland- Minimum truckload quantity of 1/4 of a load must be met.
